
ALTERNATE #1 ALTERNATE #2

Union School Conference Room Lincoln School

Construct Connect
30 Technology Parkway South, Suite 100 

Norcross GA 30092
513-458-8523

Erica.France@ConstructConnect.com;

John.Doroy@construction.com
No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

PWXPress 1900 Coffeeport Rd, Jacksonville, FL 32208 408-676-8941  408-676-8941 bids@pwxpress.com No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

AMCO Enterprises, Inc 600 Swenson Drive, Kenilworth, NJ 07033 908-241-4177 908-241-4179 mheaton@amco-enterprises.com No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

H&S Construction & Mechanical
721 Bayway Ave.

Elizabeth, NJ 07202
(908) 352-4345 (908) 352-0644 gbergen@hsmechanical.com No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

Environmental Climate Control
51 PATERSON AVE

WALLINGTON, NJ 07057

(973) 777-7470 (office)

(973) 559-4296 (direct)
 973-777-7041 Estimating@ecchvac.com No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

EACM Corp.
20 MERIDIAN ROAD

EATONTOWN, NJ 07724
732-842-4777 732-842-4744 solangie@eacmcorp.com 416,000.00$                 113,700.00$                 430,000.00$                 959,700.00$                 

Framan Mechanical Inc
259 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE

FORDS, NJ 08863
732-661-0001 732-661-0002 dmanginelli@framanmechanical.com No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

M&M CONSTRUCTION COMPANY, 

INC.

33 COMMERCE DRIVE

CRANFORD, NJ 07016
908-351-1177 908-351-3871 jmauti@m-mnj.com No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

Envirocon LLC
83 CANADA GOOSE DRIVE

HACKETTSTOWN, NJ 07840
908-813-1600 908-813-0460 az@enviroconusa.com 382,940.00$                 52,700.00$                   364,640.00$                 800,280.00$                 

SUNNYFIELD CORP
3413 ROSE AVE

OCEAN, NJ 07712
732-922-0006 732-922-1550 nsapnar@sunnyfieldcorp.com 337,000.00$                 57,000.00$                   319,000.00$                 713,000.00$                 

Centralpack Engineering Corp.
P.O. Box 359 - 359 Green Pond Road

Hibernia, NJ 07842
973-625-9230 973-625-4240 jackie.delaura@centralpackeng.com No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

Dodge Construction Network
2860 South Highway 161, Suite 160 #501, 

Grand Prairie, TX 75052-7361
844-326-3826 Elaine.Wilson@construction.com No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

Pattman Plumbing, Heating and A/C, 

Inc.

80 Greenwood Avenue Suite 10

Midland Park, NJ 07432
201-444-6867 201-444-6443 jack@pattmanplumbing.com No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

T.M. BRENNAN SERVICE, INC.
3505 ROUTE 94

HAMBURG, NJ 07419
973-500-2501 jess@tmbrennaninc.com 349,000.00$                 75,000.00$                   349,000.00$                 773,000.00$                 

GDS MECHANICAL, INC.
39 E. HANOVER AVE - SUITE C2

MORRIS PLAINS, NJ 07950
973-223-5553 973-993-9199 Monir@gdsmechanical.com 520,000.00$                 102,000.00$                 478,000.00$                 1,100,000.00$              

Thassian Mechanical Contracting, 

Inc.

641 State Route 36

Belford, NJ 07718
732-787-3300 732-787-3363 estimating@thassian.com No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

Single Overall Contract

BIDDER'S LIST

UNIT VENTILATOR REPLACEMENTS @ LINCOLN SCHOOL AND UNION SCHOOL

Prepared by: Parette Somjen Architects

Bids Due:2024-11-21 @ 1:00 PM

PSA No.: 9486, 9500

EMAILBIDDER ADDRESS TELEPHONE FAX TOTAL BIDBASE BID


